TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

I1.5.-21.Te.-31.-05122023-250417
CG-DL-E-05122023-250417

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —ave 3—SI-T@7 (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 690] ¢ Reeeht, AT, e 4, 2023/33TA 13, 1945
No. 690] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, DECEMBER 4, 2023/AGRAHAYANA 13, 1945
g i

T2 foeett, 1 fomwae, 2023

TT. &R, 873(37).—F=1 ALHTL, FolT HLEA AfAtaad, 2001 (2001 7 52) FY &12T 56 FIT V=
AITRAT T TN FXd g, Holl a&qdT 430 6 3T HalHaerd (TAUHSSs) i Hfh T Far Faeft o =7
Reee MemmEst 2012 & gerree & forg Metted FEa aqmdr g, oo -
1. |Fer A ST WA~ (i) =77 e 7 "fered AT ST 227aT s43T % 39 HelHaers (TAuasss) Agike
A FAT "t o e e Ferree e, 2023 2

(ii) T TISTIS § Tk THT Al A & Jgcd gl
2. SIT TAAT 3T 6 I ARIHRTF (TAUASSS) AT [FgfF o Far daet o o7 Aegs Faw 2012 (R
THH TEE TAT I (FIH FFT AT 8) T ATGHAT H, ST HGTAQ9TF (THATRT) F T2 F T H, -

(F) @9 (4) ", "N=14 - = 37400-67000 + I a7 % 10000" req%N, 3ihi ¥ 9Tsal F T UL
‘I AfeFT § T 14 (144200-218200 F9U)” 9167, 3 3f¥ STEAT T STUI;

[ o N e N e o

(@) w9 (6) @, "feoqur % w1+ o, Meferied "fevaor” @r STus, sred;-

7481 G1/2023 1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

ooy - sr-ET Metha w f [t o aa § st & srae ar we f sifaw aie
ERMT, (3789, FaTE, Jeum=a Teor, sy, aforqE, anmee, B, [fEm, s siv e [er s

fRam=rer w=er & =4t 5 F aift SU-wed &, AT 3T e g1 93g, FEr AT AAGT qF 5T 9
 srefaa & srfafer),”

(M) T (7) |, -

() ¥ () § "sraeTE" ST "ArEA " o Tt & A, AT ST AT AT AT AT FRATL
77 3 =T e srefamer a1 St RS i srefaeE" Sreat T i AT SITuA;

(i) TR offuF F e, "7 (i) 7, "AT AT @AW" q5at F 999, AT S o] =ul”
9TeT T STU;

() =49 (11) ¥, W= (ji) #, "4 - %.37400-67000 + I Fa7 .8700", FeATT, i AT T F w47
I "Iqe Hiewd | T 13 (123100-215900 &9)" 9Tea, 37 ¥ 77T TG STUT; <

(3.)FH (1) ¥, "gooe qu" Q&1 % T I¢ "Agrad au” ee1 T A0
3. 36 At # 3v warHeers (A=) # -

(F) T (4) &, "4 - = 37400-67000 + I FaT % 10000" 7Y, sl 3T =2t F T T
“Iae HicaHd | T 14 (144200-218200 ®9T)” 977, 3o 3T FAL TG SATU;

(@) =W (6) |, "fevqor & wqre uz, fReferfea "feoqor” Tt ST, sreia-

"feequr - S-ET R F3  [oriaes arie aed | JEiE ¥ Eed T S A ffay i
EOAT, (7, HATed, somEe Yed, s, witre, annds, B, Wi, are o efif fer v
fRm=rer w=er & =@t 5 F aieft IU-wed &, seHT 3T RhE 31T 99g, FEr AT AAGT JF OST &9
& TEITAAT o AT Ta),”

@@ w9 (7) ¥, -
(i) FreaTe a7 o= " oreat & w19 9 " A fHersar 9 F e yEaya ore) T ST,
(i) AT SIS Fa | AT AT oreat AT FA S,

(=) w9 (11) ®, 7= (i) &, "f=t4 - = 37400-67000 + I Fa= = 8700", A, Hl ¥ a=af
& T 9T "aqer ffT § =97 13 (123100-215900 F9T)" 9oTex, 3 3T 31&7T TG S0,

(8) w9 (1) ¥, " FoUF a9 " 9Tea[ & ST I "AgET a9 " 9058 T ST
[T, /. 13/11/2021-2H1]
EEPRRCIE N EEC

feoqur - g7 M 9d F OO | 9w |, @9 3, I9-gT () § v 780 (1) e
22 TFFEY, 2012 G YT e 717 2



[¢TRT [I—=vE 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

MINISTRY OF POWER
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 1st December, 2023

G.S.R. 873(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 56 of the Energy Conservation Act, 2001
(52 of 2001), the Central Government, hereby makes the following rules to amend the Bureau of Energy Efficiency
Appointment and Terms and Conditions of Service of Deputy Director General (NMEEE) Rules, 2012, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (i) These rules may be called the Bureau of Energy Efficiency Appointment and
Terms and Conditions of Service of Deputy Director General (NMEEE) Amendment Rules, 2023.

(i) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Schedule to the Bureau of Energy Efficiency Appointment and Terms and Conditions of Service of Deputy
Director General (NMEEE) Rules, 2012 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in the post relating to the Deputy
Director General (Technical), —

(@ in column (4), for the letters, figures and words “PB4- Rs.37400-67000 + Grade Pay Rs.10000”, the
words, figures and letters “level 14 (Rs.144200-218200) in the pay matrix” shall be substituted;

(b) in column (6), for “Note”, the following “Note”, shall be substituted, namely:-

“Note : The crucial date for determining the age-limit shall be closing date for receipt of applications from candidates
in India, (other than those in Assam, Meghalaya, Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Nagaland, Tripura, Sikkim,
Lahual and Spiti District and Pangi sub-division of Chamba District of Himachal Pradesh, Union Territory of
Andaman and Nicobar Islands, Ladakh or Lakshadweep),”

(c) in column (7), --
(i)  under the headings “Essential” and “Desirable”, in item (i), the words “or Economics or Applied

Economics or Business or Finance or Industrial Economics or Energy Planning and Economics”
shall be omitted;

(if) under the heading “Desirable”, in item (i), after the words, “or Chemistry”, the words “or Master
degree in” shall be inserted,

(d) in column (11), in item (ii), for the letters, figures and words “PB4 - Rs.37400-67000 + Grade Pay
Rs. 87007, the words, figures and letters “level 13 (Rs.123100-215900) in the pay matrix” shall be
substituted; and

(e) in column (11), for the words “fifty-six years” the words “fifty-eight years” shall be substituted.
3. In the said rules, in Deputy Director General (Finance), —

(@ in column (4), for the letters, figures and words “PB4 - Rs. 37400-67000 + Grade Pay Rs.10000”, the
words, figures and letters “level 14 (Rs.144200-218200) in the pay matrix” shall be substituted;

(b) in column (6), for “Note”, the following “Note” shall be substituted, namely:-

“Note : The crucial date for determining the age-limit shall be closing date for receipt of applications from candidates
in India (other than those in Assam, Meghalaya, Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Nagaland, Tripura, Sikkim,
Lahual and Spiti District and Pangi sub-division of Chamba District of Himachal Pradesh, Union Territory of
Andaman and Nicobar Islands, Ladakh or Lakshadweep),”

(c) in column (7),—

(i)  for the words “Business or Finance”, the words “ Business Administration with Finance Specialization”
shall be substituted;

(ii) the words “or Bachelor Degree in Engineering and Business” shall be omitted,;

(d) in column (11), in item (ii), for the letters, figures and words “PB4- Rs.37400-67000 + Grade Pay Rs. 87007,
the words, figures and letters “level 13 (Rs.123100-215900) in the pay matrix™ shall be substituted;

(e) in column (11), for the words “fifty-six years” the words “fifty-eight years” shall be substituted.

[F. No.13/11/2021-EC]
AJAY TEWARI, Addl. Secy.

NOTE:- The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India Extraordinary Part Il, Section 3, sub-section (i)
as G.S.R. 780(E) dated 22" October, 2012.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054., &a™




		2023-12-05T14:01:33+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




